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The Danish tax authorities (SKAT) on May 4 issued an executive order that implements the 
transfer pricing documentation recommendations from Action 13 of the OECD’s base 
erosion and profit shifting (BEPS) Action Plan, including the master file/local file 
requirements. 

Since the release of the final OECD BEPS reports in October 2015, Denmark has worked 
on implementing the three-tiered approach to transfer pricing documentation described in 
Action 13 into Danish legislation. 

The Danish parliament on December 18, 2015, approved new transfer pricing legislation 
introducing country-by-country (CbC) reporting requirements. The new Danish CbC 
reporting requirements apply as of January 1, 2016. In addition to the new act, a draft 
executive order on CbC reporting was submitted for consultation on April 6, 2016. Once 
finalized, the draft executive order will specify certain technical details, as well as provide 
further details on the information and format to be contained in the CbC report. 

Parallel to the implementation of the CbC reporting requirements, Denmark has been 
working on an update of its transfer pricing documentation requirements. The May 4 
executive order implements the transfer pricing documentation recommendations from 
BEPS Action 13. As of FY 2016, Danish companies subject to the transfer pricing 
documentation requirements will have to prepare a master file and a local file. 

Together, the new Danish CbC reporting requirements and the new transfer pricing 
documentation requirements effectively finalize the Danish implementation of the OECD’s 
three-tiered approach. 

Danish companies subject to the new transfer pricing legislation should expect a significant 
increase in compliance costs, compared to costs under the prior legislation.  

Country-by-Country Reporting 

According to the new Danish CbC reporting requirements, Danish companies are obligated 
to file a CbC report if the following conditions are met: 

• The multinational group’s consolidated turnover exceeds DKK 5.6 billion (approx. EUR 
750 million) in the financial year preceding the reporting year of the CbC report; and 

• The group’s ultimate parent company is resident in Denmark for tax purposes. 

If the Danish company is not the ultimate parent company or not a tax resident of Denmark, 
the company need not prepare a CbC report under the Danish legislation. However, if the 



group’s ultimate parent company is resident in a country that does not have a CbC reporting 
requirement, the rules may apply nevertheless. 

The Danish CbC reporting requirement provides that Danish companies that are not the 
ultimate parent company shall prepare a CbC report if the Danish company is a tax resident 
of Denmark and one or more of the following conditions are met: 

• The group’s ultimate parent company is not required to file a CbC report in the country 
where it is resident for tax purposes; 

• The CbC report is not automatically exchanged with Denmark through a specific 
agreement between the Danish competent authority and the jurisdiction of the ultimate 
parent company (even if a double tax treaty or similar agreement may exist); or 

• The Danish company has been notified by the Danish tax authorities of a “systemic 
failure” by the ultimate parent company’s country of residence to provide the CbC 
report to the Danish tax authorities. 

In addition, the Danish regulations include a final exemption. A Danish company that is not 
the ultimate parent company, but is required to provide a CbC report because of one of the 
conditions listed above may not be required to provide the CbC report if it notifies the Danish 
tax authorities that another group company has been appointed surrogate parent company. 

If no exemption applies, the CbC report must be filed with the Danish tax authorities no later 
than 12 months after the end of the fiscal year. 

It should be noted that SKAT must be notified by the end of 2016 of which entity will submit 
the CbC report covering the Danish entity to which the Danish CbC legislation applies, and 
where this entity is resident for tax purposes. Thus, groups with Danish entities are advised 
to look into which group entity will prepare the CbC report. Although Denmark has aligned 
its implementation of the CbC reporting rules with the OECD guidance, other counties may 
add country-specific requirements into their local legislation. Therefore, it is further 
recommended that companies review the various local requirements when the CbC report is 
prepared. 

As a supplement to the Danish CbC reporting legislation, a draft executive order was sent 
into consultation on April 6, 2016. Once finalized, the draft executive order will provide 
further details on the specific information to be filed and guidance on the format of the 
submission. 

On January 27, 2016, Denmark, along with 30 other counties, participated in the signing 
ceremony for the OECD Multilateral Competent Authority Agreement (MCAA). From a 
Danish perspective, the signing of the MCAA effectively ensures the exchange of CbC 
reports between the Danish tax authorities and local tax authorities that have signed the 
MCAA. As of May 6, 2016, 33 countries had signed the MCAA. 

At present, several countries have already implemented, or are in the process implementing, 
CbC reporting requirements into national law. Parallel to the national implementation 
process, the EU Commission has drafted a revision to the Administrative Cooperation 
Directive, which was published on January 28, 2016, as part of the EU Anti-Tax Avoidance 
Package. The draft proposes mandatory implementation of the OECD’s CbC reporting 
requirements within the EU. 

Denmark generally supports international standards regarding transfer pricing. Therefore, it 
is expected that Denmark will support the EU Commission’s proposed directives. 

New Danish transfer pricing documentation requirements 

The new executive order on transfer pricing documentation published May 4 replaces the 
former executive order on transfer pricing documentation, and generally follows the transfer 
pricing documentation recommendations from the BEPS Action 13 final report. As a result of 
this alignment with the international standard, the former specific Danish requirements, such 
as inclusion of the past three years of earnings before interest and tax (EBIT) and revenue, 
are not included in the new executive order. 

Danish companies subject to the new Danish transfer pricing documentation requirements 
will have to prepare a master file and a local file in accordance with the new executive order 
as of FY 2016. 

The exact level of detail of the transfer pricing documentation is for companies to decide, 
and depends on the extent and complexity of the group and its intercompany transactions. 
Under the new executive order, companies are required to include significantly more 



information and material, and perform more detailed analyses than under the prior executive 
order. 

Danish transfer pricing documentation may be prepared in Danish, Swedish, Norwegian, or 
English. 

The new Danish master file requirements generally follow those specified in Annex I of the 
“Transfer Pricing Documentation and Country-by-Country Reporting Final Report.” Thus, 
companies are required to include comprehensive information regarding drivers of business 
profits and the supply chain, including a description of the group’s five largest 
products/services measured by revenue, intangibles, sources of financing, detailed market 
descriptions, etc. 

The information included in the master file shall be information that applies to the group as a 
whole. 

In addition to the master file, the new executive order requires Danish companies and 
Danish permanent establishments to prepare a local file containing company-specific 
information.  

As in the case of the master file, the new executive order generally follows the OECD BEPS 
Action 13 guidance, and thus must contain the information specified in Annex II of the 
“Transfer Pricing Documentation and Country by Country Reporting Final Report.” 

Some of the information to be included in the local file is similar to the information required 
under the prior Danish transfer pricing documentation requirements. However, companies 
should expect the level of detail of the information and analyses required to be higher under 
the new executive order. The new executive order also requires new types of information, 
including copies of intercompany agreements, detailed information regarding local 
management, reconciliation spreadsheets that explain how the intercompany transaction 
volumes can be reconciled to the annual accounts, and allocation of roles and 
responsibilities of key employees. 

In summary, the information required under the new statutory order is significantly more 
comprehensive and detailed than was required under the former Danish transfer pricing 
documentation requirements. 

Penalties 

The already existing Danish transfer pricing penalty regime will continue to apply following 
the introduction of the new requirements for transfer pricing documentation, and will also 
apply to the new CbC reporting requirements.  

Conclusion 

The new Danish transfer pricing rules adopting the OECD’s three-tiered approach are 
significantly more prescriptive than the prior rules with respect to the specific information to 
be provided. 

By introducing the new legislation on CbC reporting requirements and signing the MCAA, 
Denmark has effectively taken all the necessary steps to implement the CbC reporting 
requirements into Danish law. Danish companies subject to the Danish CbC reporting 
requirements will have to closely observe the ongoing status of the MCAA and similar CbC 
exchange agreements, to ensure that the group company that is preparing the CbC report 
on behalf of the group is located in a country that has signed the MCAA. Otherwise, a copy 
of the CbC report must be submitted to the Danish tax authorities.  

The new Danish transfer pricing documentation requirements will require Danish companies 
to rethink their transfer pricing documentation if they have prepared documentation in 
accordance with existing rules. For many companies, the new regulations will require a new 
level of global coordination and documentation. In addition, the revised guidance contained 
in the OECD BEPS Action 8-10 report will have to be observed when preparing transfer 
pricing documentation. Specifically, thorough analyses will be necessary regarding the 
allocation of risks, functions, and actual decision making. 
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